REGD. NO. D.L.-33004/99

TRt s Ee Tep-33004/99

Gazette of

EXTRAORDINARY

N7 I—¥v3 3—I9-a79% () .
PART II—Sectidn 3—Sub-section (i)

TSR | TSI
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY .
4. 251] 7 fooehl, TeehER, 3 9, 200594 19, 1927
No. 251] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, JUNE 9, 2005/JYAISTHA 19,1927

HER SR gEW S e

(S9R I SR F9949)
= o=, 9 579, 2005
L. 385(3). — =T SR, T AR SIuiTEE, 1885 (1885 W 13) W U 4 SR ¥R 7 8K W& WiRE =

A S g, RGE SAR-TR ity (Fargeet dan) Fem, 1978 = oK e e § fag, frefaten fem e g,
T i —
1. dferm T SR IR~ (1) 37 Tl = S 9 TR SaR-an i (SargRie 5 e e, 2005 7
(2) 3 TS99 § TR FI GG S g9 87|
2. YRATS SaR-aR Gt (Sargsier aar) fE, 1978 (f—&mwm sw sy, e s
R Fr=fataa e T smom, et —
"4, Tl & Worl ; TSIl o Fa B, ST —
(i) TN SAR-TR F% STa0a (FE)
(i) Fargeiel SaR-aR % gara (Fef) 1’
3. I & e s §,—
(%) wuf=m (1) F g |, % oeia goi- z“wemera?r%wm”éa—«;aﬁr%(ﬁafw)”mw
FrEH T |
(@) wufed (2) 7, ''safmEm (1) F Ers’ | T B A IR oTIRe R el 8 W I e A v,
Hrgeni, &R AR Fl o T W FAfafas v, Frow, STaR W@ S, S —
" sufrE (1) FETE (@) § e 9 T g o, R TR 12 § 18 91 3 He H1 3Ng & qaras g
ﬁmﬁww—mwwaﬁ(w)mmﬁméﬁmmhmﬁ(ﬁéﬁr)aﬁaﬁaaﬁzﬁaﬁzm

ST
l

T

1770 Gl/2005 (1)



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [Part I—Sec.3(1)]
4. e P i o 7 —
(%) @vs (Q) ¥ wr | F=fafen gve @ smem, s —
‘(@) T f et e W) S w0, e

~

(i) TETEieT S FETer Tan (HER) — 100/~ T9T
(i) YerEie S yere sian (FEfia) — 100/~ F9T

(@) @7 () T @AM e
5. s 9w % w8 & sufem (2) % v R Frefafea faw w@n s, sai —
“(2)==fﬁwrh%ww 2 # oTqwia & g i3 e, Sifeq Tien & I0E 9 I8 T 9F $ A9vEr, 781 59
S
6. 3 T7a9 & fram 11 % w=m ) Fefates Fam v e, sai:—
‘1. T @ S—(1) T PR ¥ o seT B oTieta, STERa ¥ W # aire § diw o
e 1 srafy & fou s e sem SR S fg S & 917 % Yoo 918 S S aE TR 1 STEEE 5T |
Ty :— 59 TR &y & A S 9 § A9 HRe 1 80 Y W ST WIS EAT ST1Hdd € |
(2)?13—@?1'mmﬁfuwa?ﬁmaﬁﬁﬁgmawmﬁmmﬁﬁaﬁmﬁ@ww10'-=men
for foem Fr s W= 21
7. 557 Tram & Tam 12 ° =t (1) % @ R Fefatea safvem w@r s, s :—
H(1) FETT TER F SIS TR EH W AR 39F g i Of 9§ s wiw 58 R w fefates wrEe
HIER §F B i —

FA B T ' T T8 H
, 205 S =
(i) TaTEieT SaR-IR 991 $% SFgga (FER) 1000 2000
(ii) FETTeREl SAR-IR ¥ F% A9 (Feffm) 1000 2000

g.sH R S T 14 T sum (1) ¥ :—
(F) “ayferfs, o T S RE R EE T W= @ W ;
(@) de (M) Fur R FeEatae g @ e, Jui c—
(M) 1000/~ TIY B T FHm'
9. 3 e a9 159, —
(1) "IV FEA R TE Tl = @
(i) “'eETon’” sl F wE W g v e 1@ W,
‘s w7 S e s T el § e RS 9 euy e 1@ Sg
1. S F g 1s Fsuf@=g (1) §,—
(%) @ (ii) F vm R Fr=fafan @vs v s, s :—
(i) SATEE, T SaR-TR SR oTgEra (FERY) 4R &y
(@) @s (iii) § 10 TUq’’ o7l IR U=l & TH WV “ 200/ U’ weg IR ST @ W L
12. =0 e & g9 20 ¥ 3afm (2) §,—
(F) @7 (i) |10/~ 390" Tl SR =) H TH R 1100/~ FAQ 3 IR I W@ WG |
(@) T (i) d *'5/- T9u’’ o AR v=el % T W 100/~ 79 o AR W @ Wi |
[ . €. TH.~14011/255/2004-TTHT ]

, S9-TTE (1) § o "Jﬂ o |, WL 1499/73 9 25 FEgE

B 17 MY, 1984 TR WINTYT T SHIY T

1073 g waeE SR g @ S E, wmow i 122



T I—vs 3(1)] YA o T : SR

MINISTRY OF COMMUNICATIONS AND INFORMATION TECHNOLGGY
(Wireless Planning and Co-ordination)
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 9th June, 2005

G.S.R 385(E)— In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 4 and 7 of the Indian
Telegraph Act, 1885 (13 of 1885), the Central Government hereby makes the following
rules further to amend the Indian Wireless Telegraphs (Amateur Service) Rules,1978,

namely:-

B Short title and commencement- (1) These rules may be called the Indian Wireless -

Telegraphs (Amateur Service ) Amendment Rules, 2005.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2 In the Indian Wireless Telegraphs (Amateur Service) Rules, 1978 (hereinafter
referred to as “the said rules’), for nile 4, the following rule shaH be substituted, namely:-

“4. Categories of licence: There shall be two categories of licences, namely;-
(1) Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (General)
(i1) Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (Restricted).”

5 In rule 5 of the said rules,-

(a) in sub-rule (1), in the proviso, for the words and figure ** Station Licence
Grade- II”, the words and brackets “Station Licence (Restricted)” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-rule (2), for the portion beginning with the words “ Notwithstanding
any thing contained” and ending with the words, Short Wave Listners’ Amateur
Wireless Telegraph Station Llcence , the following words, brackets and letters shall be
SUbbtlfUted namely:-

* Notwithstanding anything contained in clause (b) of sub-rule (1), the Central
Government may grant to bonafide experimenters between the age of 12 and 18 years,
Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (General) or Amateur Wireless Telegraph

Station Licence(Restricted):”.

4. In rule 7 of the said rules, -
(a) for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
“(b) such person pays the fees on the following scale, namely :
(1) Amateur Station Operators’ Examination (General) - Rs. 100/-
(i1) Amateur Station Operators’ Examination (Restricted) - Rs. 100/-"

{b) clause {c) shall be omitted.

5 In rule 8 of the said rules, for sub-rule (2) the following sub-rule shall be

substituted, namely ;-
“ (2) An application for licence in Annexure-II to the rules shall be submitted not later

than one month before the date of desired examination.”

0. Forrule 11 of the said rules, the following rule shall be substituted, namely:-
“11. Period of Validity- (1) A licence granted under these rules shall be issued for a
od of 20 years or lifelong as the case may be commencing on the date of issue of the

(%

”\.u ce and expiring on the last day of the month preceding the month of issue.
Explanarion:- For the purposes of this rule, the expression “life long” means till
the licence holder attains the age of 80 years.



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [ParT I—S&c. 3(1)] ~

(2) 'Validity of lifelong licence r-nayv be extended on spemﬁc feéiueé?of the licence holder
for 10 years at a time without any additional payment.” '

7. - In rule 12 of the said rules, for sub-rule(1), the following sub-rule shall be |

substituted, namely : - ‘
“(1) A licence fee on the following scale shall be payable to the Central Government on

receipt of instructions from that Government and in the manner directed by it:-

Fees in Rupees
Category of licence

‘ ! 20 Years Life long
(i)  Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station 1000 2000
iicenee (General) '

(i)  Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station 1000 2000
Licence (Restricted)

8. In rule 14 of the said rules, in sub-rule (1);-
(a) for the words “two or five years, as the case may be,” the words “twenty

years,” shall be substituted;
(b) for clause (c), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“(c) Pays a fee of Rs. 1000/-"

9. In rule 15 of the said rules,-
{(1)for the words “two years”, the words “five years” shall be substituted;
(ii)for letters and figures “Rsi0/-”, the letters and figures , “Rs100/-" shall be

substituted ©

10. In the said rules, in the proviso of rule 17, for the words “rupees five” , “Rs.200/-"
shall be substituted . ' :

11. In the rule 18-of the said rules, in sub-rule (1),

(a) for clause (ii), the following clause shall be substituted namely:-

“(i1) the applicant'holds an Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (General)”
(b) in clause (iii), for the letters and figures “Rs. 10/-”, the letter and figures “Rs. 200/-”
shall be substituted.

12, Inthe rule 20 of the said rules, in sub-rule (2) , -
(a) in clause (i), for the letters and figures “Rs. 10/-”, the letters and figures “Rs. 100/-"
shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (i1), for the letters and figures “Rs. 5/-”, the letters and figures “Rs. 100/-"
shall be substituted.

[F. No.L-14011/255/2004-AMT]
C. RAMA RAOQ, Assistant Wireless Adviser

Note : The Principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Par_t 1 Section 3, Sub-section (i) vide No. G.S.R.
1499/78 dated the 25th October, 1978 and amended vide No. G.S.R. 1225/84 dated 17th October, 1984.

Printed by the Manager, Govt. of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Dethi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



