
~~o~o ~-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99 

:J ll~cl oh~. ~151qjl 
Q:he <EJa-:tette of ~ndia 

dHilfil(Uf 
EXTRAORDINARY 

'1flT II-~ 3-0'1-~ (i) 
PART Il-S(!Ctidn 3-Sub-section (i) 

!Hfti<fl!'( ~ 51 Cfl 1!lId '-· 

PUBl.JSHED BY AUTHORITY 

~- 251] ~ ~' i{~fGfdC!I<, il[9' 9, 2005~ 19, 1927 

No. 251] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, JUNE 9, 2005/JYAfSTH..A 19, 1927 

~ ¢iR. ~ sila1r.qi') ~ 


cm~~~) 


Oi~f!."''Ml 


"9{ ~. 9 ~. 2005 


m."<:flT.f.i. 3as{a:;).-~~, ~<l"R-31f~, 1885(1885CfiT13) "iit ~ 4 am~ 7 IDU~~CfiT 
>r<Wr ·cr.{o si 'iil{11l<i q(li{-(ITT ~ c~ '"llJ~ncti *"rr) f.;<:rl:r, 1978 cnr ·31-'h mrr~..,. cnf.1 in"~ f'1=ifC'1forn mi:r ~ t 
31?~;-

1. "Bfll:l""t{f 1fl'f zj]-OITT'lf.-( 1 ) ~~ Ci'iT~ 1fl1 ~-a:m-<l"R~ ( ~'"llj~fl"?i Bcrr) ~1:Rf.r<iq, 2005 t I 

( 2 ) "<) {f\;j"qop?f ~ cnl mfnsr cnT ~ ifTr I 

2. 'l-i~-.tm:-(i!{~· ( ~<ilJ~flflJ ~) f.:r:r+:r, 1978 ( l"lfl ~ ~fiq, ~·-acRi~~Pi7:rrt'), f.r<iq 4 iii""8-TI1 

11{ P1=ifC'll<S11 f.;<:rl:r ~~. -3121Tit. :­

, ' r-. ,. ~ ,. R ·y· .... .... ,. ......... ,.

4. -3'i j'ii NFl I en >fC!TT : 3'1 J ~ <-0 lJ I er.> <:] W'r1 mrT, 312.lTil, : ­

Ci) - ~'"llJ~n\.'11-a:m-(ITT~ ~c~) 

(ii) ~'"llj~ncti-a:m-(ITT~ ~c~~) 1" 

3. -acRi f.:r:r:1 in" f.:r:r:1 5 if, ­

(q;) ~ (1) iii"~if, "~~~-2"~a:i'h:~ii;-~'1{ "~~(~)"~ ·a:m: 

~W~I 

(~) ~ (2) if, ''~(1)iii"~''~~"ITT~zj]-z··~q;z~t··~~-rn~~. 

~, 31ll:lii 3TI<: ~in" m '1{ P1=ifC1forn ~' ~. -31~ ~~. 31~ :­

"~ ( 1) iii"~(~) if fcnmO'lrn iii"itff ~ ~. ~~ 12 ~ 18 crf iii"i:r&r cnl~ in" CllfctlCl<ti SllJl'ICfidlaTI 

CfiT ~'"llj~flfll <tm:-mi:Bc!T~ ~(~)<if ~'"llj~flC'll <tm:-mi:~ ~(~)~~q;{~ 

1770 Gl/200 5 (I) 



2 THE GAZE1TE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART Il-SEC.3(i)] 

4. 	~ f.FTtj ~ f.fc:rq 7 .q,­
(Cf>) ~ (G') *~'R P1YfC1foH1 ~~~, 31~ : ­

"(ii) ~-~r:;.-,-p<:'lf©<l~~mq;r~<RTr, ;q~:" · 

100/-~ 

Cii ) ~<llji/nt'11~~~c~) 100/-~ 


( G') .~ ( Tf) q;r "ffr:t fcn<:rr ~ I 


5. ~f.fc:rq*f.fc:rq 8 *~ (2) *~-q\ f"1"'1fcifuJct f.fc:rq~~I 31~ : ­

I I ( 2) ~~ * ~-2if~*~~~J ciifu<f 11ft&1i cn'T mfu9 it i:rct ~ +1m * ~ -m ~ 


6. 	~ f.i<R*f.i<R 11 ~BiTI''R f..:cYfctl'<9(1 ~~~, 31~:-

'' 11 . ~ cn'T arcrf'tl-( 1) ~~ ~ 31~ ~ cfilt ~,~~~ cn'T mfm it -.ftB q:q '<l"T 
\111ci.,q<f"d q,'T ~*~ "irft fcti<:JT ~~ "irft ~~~~~~~ cift ~mfra cit~WTI I 

fqtf1Cfi{O/ :-~f.P-:lii*~ ~i'ffii:" "11ci.,q..j'(1 "i::r<:"B ~'l:ITTCfi'q;r 80 qcf 9fr~ ]Tt(fQT:ir ~%I 

( 2) ~jq.,qlfct ~cn'Tfc!f~-i:rp:mr~'l:ITTCfi'~ fctfi~oe: 3Tj"{r'tl'Rfi:Rr fcr.til a.i-fuftcRi~*~~'« 10Cfl'f ~ 

i'ffii: fcrnm: fcti<:JT ~ BCfiiiT %I " 

7. ~f.i<R~f.fc:rq 12~ d'if'1<-i'i (1) *~in: f.,yf("ll'©ct~'{'&T~, 31~:-

' ' c1 ) ~mcrm: ~ ~~- ]Tt(fm in: ~~wu~frfu-B~m~~ CfiT !1Yft'll@ct ~~ 
~~~'1•~:-

~q;r~ 	 iirn~~ 

20 qcf "1l<l1q..j(j 

Ci ) ~lllji/ At'll m-mnrcrr~~(~) 1000 2000 


Cii ) ~<-il:1i/l1almm-m:i:irci1~~ c~> 1000 2000 " 


8. ~ f.fc:rq in f.i<R 14 ~ ~ ( 1) -if: ­

(en) " "<l'~, -e:r'<l"T~qcf"~ ~ ~'«"-.frnqcf"~w "11~·1; 


( (3) m- (Ti) ~ ~-Wi '« f•il'"'llt'lfol<l <S il.S Zt3T ~, 31~1,, : ­

"(-rr) 10001-~·tffr~n:izy:r~"· 


9. ~ l'1 <.j '1 in f.:;<:p:r 15 -if, ­

Ci ) "-e:rcrr"~~~in:"~qcf"~w~; 


Cii) 1 ·~~··~~~-TI'i''«''m~··~w~; 


10. "~ f.r<:ii:1in f.r<:1i::117 ~~-q "i:iRr~" ~ q, ~111: "-e:r m~"~w~ ,.. 
11 . ~ f.P-:r:1 in f.fc:rq 18 in~ (1 ) -q, ­

( en) m (ii) ~~111: f1""'1fC1foact "@1JS«Sfr~, 31~:-

" ( ii)~, ~<llji/flMl mm-on:~~ (m'l:ITT1'T) 'l:lWii"Ql;" 


(~) ~(iii ) -q " 1o~"~am~~~'11: " 2001-~" ~ am~W~I· 


12. 	~f.fc:rq~~ 20 ~~ (2) -q, ­

(en) ~(i)-q"101- ~" ~afn:~q,~in: "1001-~"3fcn~~W~1 


c~) ~Oi>-q "51- ~" ~am:~q,~111: "1001-~"3fcnam~w~1 


['Fii. 'B. ~.-14011 /255/2004-~] 

W. WITT'!Cf, ~ iroR fiC'l IQ Cfil{ 

~ ~ " . ' ) '"~ . ~ ~ 
1 .,;.·.-~i!f; ~ 1'1 <1'..f ''i'mi Cfl Tf-rftlOT, '.:rfl' II , ~ 3, ~-~ t. i , Ji <>W~*fch1T:f. ·~1.s"li.P.. !499/78 "QHl@f 25 &i~q_cr:, 

1 11 ~ i·~ ;TI! ~lhli1rr. i~;~ ricz ?.~ ·3-fi:t ~Ff. i:n . 1:;;i .f~. ·122s 
1 
·f!r{!-0 ~: 7 .~,~~~{, ·;rt84 ~rn ·ffii'rf~ ~{ ·rro 1 



/ ~"1JTT===Il==©=O=S=3=(~i))~===================='i1!m==Cfil==-0=~=q=~=:=~================================J 

MINISTRY OF COMMUNICATIONSAND INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY 


(Wireless Planning and Co-ordination) 


NOTIFICATioN 


New Delhi, the 9th June, 2005 

G.S.R385{E).- In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 4 and 7 of the Indian 
Telegraph Act~ 1885 (l 3 of 1885), the Central Government hereby makes the foliowing 
rules further to amend the Indian Wireless Telegraphs (Amateur Service) Rules, 1978, 
namely:­

1. . Short title and commencement- (1) These rules may be called the Indian Wireless . 
Telegraphs (Amateur Service) Amendment Rules: 2005 . 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 

2. In the Indian Wireless Telegraphs (Amateur Service) Rules, 1978 (hereinafter 
referred to as 'the said rules') , for rule 4, the follow-ing rule shall be substituted, namely: ­

"4. Categories of licence: There shall be two categories of licences, namely; ­
(i) Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (General) 
(ii) Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (Restricted)." 

3. In rule 5 of the said rules,­
(a) in sub-rule (1), in the proviso, for the \.VOrds and figure " Station Licence 

Grade- II", the words and brackets "Station Licence (Restricted)" shall be substituted; 
(b) in sub-rule (2), for the portion beginning with the words " Notwithstanding 

any thing contained" and ending with the words, Short V/ave Listners ' Amateur 
Wireless Telegraph Station Licence:", the following words, brackets and letters shall be 
substituted, namely: ­

" Notwithstanding anyihing contained in clause (b) of sub-rnle (1), the Ce_ntral 
· -Government may grant to bonafide experimenters between the age of 12 and 18 years, 

Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (General) or Amateur Wireless Telegraph 
Station Licence(Restricted):". 

4. In rule 7 of the said rules, ­
(a) for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:­

"(b) such person pays the fees on the following scale, namely : 
(i) Amateur Station Operators' Examination (General) - Rs. 100/­
(ii) Amateur Station Operators' Examination (Restricted) - Rs. 100/ ..:" 

(b) clause ( c) shall be omitted. 

5. In rule 8 of the said rules, for sub-rule (2) the fo llowing sub-rule shall be 
substituted, namely ;­
" (2) An application for licence. in Annexure-II to the rules shall be submitted not later 
than one month before the date of desired examination." 

6. For rule 11 of the said rules, the following rule shall be substituted, namely:­
·' I I. Period of Validity- . (1) A licence granted under these rules shall be issued for a 
per:od of 20 year..: or iifelong as the case may be commencing on the date of issue of the 
!icc:nc:e und expiring on the last day of the month preceding the month of issue . 

Explanation:- for the purposes of this rule, the expression " life long" means till 
the licence holder attl.Jins the age of 80 years. 



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PARTil-SEc. 3(i)j _;' 

(2) Validity of lifelong licence may be extended BR specific request of the licence holder 
for 10 years at a time without any additional paymerit." 

7. In rule 12 of the said rules, for sub-rule(l), the following sub-rule shall be 
substituted, namely : ­
"(l) A licence fee on the following scale shall be payable to the Central Government on 

receipt of instructions from that Government and in the manner directed by it: ­

Fees in Rupees 
Category of licence 

I 20 Years Life long 
I")\_1 Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station 1000 2000 
L i cen~e (Genernl) 

(ii ) Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station 1000 2000 
Licence (Restricted) I 

8. 	 In rule 14 of the said rules, in sub-rule (l); ­
(a) for the words "two or five years, as the case may be," the words "twenty 

years," shall be substituted; 
(b) for clause (c), the following clause .shall be substituted, namely:­

<'(c) Pays a fee of Rs . 1000/-" 

9. 	 In rule 15 of the said rules,­
(i)for the words "two years", the words "five years" shall be substituted; 
(ii)for letters and figures "RslO/-", the letters and figures , "RslOO/-" shall be 

substituted " 

10. In the said rules, in the proviso of rule 17, for the words "rupees five", "Rs.200/-" 
shall be substituted . · 

11. 	 In the rule 18 of the said rules, in sub-rule (1 ), 

(a) for clause (ii), the following clause shall be substituted namely:­

"(ii) the applicant holds an. Amateur Wireless Telegraph Station Licence (General)" 
(b) in clause (iii), for the letters and figures "Rs. 101-'', the letter and figures "Rs. 200/-" 
shall be substituted. 

12. 	 In the rule 20 of the said rules, in sub-rule (2) , ­
(a.) in clause (i), for the letters and figures "Rs. 10/-", the letters and figures "Rs. 100/-" 
shall be substituted;· 

(b) in clause {il.), for the letters and figures "Rs. 51-", the letters and figilres "Rs. I 00/-" 
shall be substituted. · 

[F. No. L-14011/255/2004-AMT] 

C. RAMA RAO, Assistant Wireless Adviser 

Note: The Principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Part If; Section 3, Sub-section (i) vide No. G.S.R. 

1499/78 dated the 2jth October, 1978 and amended vide No. G.S.R 1225/84 dated 17th October, 1984. 

Printed by the Manager, Govt. of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064 
and Publ ished by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-1100.54. 


